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Summary 
Governments, civil society groups, and international organisations actively raise awareness about 
major environmental risks and work to mitigate them. In practice, however, sustainable 
development tends to be approached in stages: first by addressing the economic dimension, 
followed by the environmental, and finally, the social dimension. We argue that this sequencing 
reflects an inherent bias in how the importance of each dimension is perceived, with the social 
dimension consistently being undervalued. We challenge the prevailing notion that the social 
dimension is synonymous with poverty and is detrimental to natural resources. Instead, we propose 
that sustainable development must shift towards a model of socially sustainable development. Our 
findings suggest that socially sustainable development is more closely aligned with addressing 
inequity and enhancing capabilities, rather than merely alleviating poverty. It is therefore essential 
to move beyond the outdated view that economics and environmental protection are in conflict. 
Instead, we must frame the environment as a matter of human justice, where the social dimension 
is given its rightful importance. In this context, we present three key pillars of analysis—equity, 
safety, and social cohesion—to renew the sustainability debate and mitigate the disruptions caused 
by imbalances between the dimensions. 
 
JEL Classification: Q01, Q26, Q50. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
1 This work was carried out within the framework of the Camargue Health-Environment "Zone Atelier" (ZACAM) 
of the "Long-Term Socio-Ecological Research network" (LTSER-RZA), funded by the Ecology & Environment of 
the French National Center for Scientific Research (EE-CNRS). 

https://orcid.org/0000-0002-3980-2671
https://orcid.org/0000-0002-0020-5044
https://orcid.org/0000-0003-2238-1978
https://orcid.org/0000-0002-1090-6418


2 
 

 
In recent years, citizens' movements like the Climate Strike have urged governments to address 
major environmental risks, while others, such as the more apolitical 'yellow vest' movement in 
France, have taken opposing stances on environmental issues. The 'yellow vest' protests began as 
a spontaneous response to a diesel tax increase. Instead of embracing the environmental rationale 
behind the policy, they viewed the French government’s proposed ecological transition as a direct 
assault on their purchasing power. This reaction is not an isolated example of 'anti-environment' 
protests. Bhatti and Dixon (2003), along with Burningham and Thrush (2003), similarly noted that 
the UK government's increased taxation on domestic heating oil—intended to shift energy 
consumption away from fossil fuels—was perceived by the public as an attempt to prevent them 
from heating their homes. 
Should we then conclude that a social divide exists, where different social classes find themselves 
in opposing camps? Certain comments and opinions from 'yellow vest' members appear to support 
this notion (Huyghe et al., 2019). Attempts to bridge the gap between the Climate Strike and the 
'yellow vest' movement failed, suggesting that these groups may indeed be disconnected from each 
other. Beyond potential class divisions, this situation highlights a fundamental flaw in the 
conceptualization of sustainable development. 
 
A lesser dimension 
 
Sustainable development is generally understood to consist of three interconnected dimensions: 
economic, environmental, and social. The dominant view tends to associate sustainable 
development primarily with environmental protection, nature conservation, and the promotion of 
ecological values. In fact, many people do not clearly distinguish between these aspects (cf. Bazin, 
2006 for clarification) or between reconciling economic growth and environmental preservation 
(ecosystem integrity). The social dimension—defined as equality of opportunity and the freedom 
to be or to act—has often been overlooked. The Brundtland Report (WCED, 1987) significantly 
contributed to this by emphasizing the conditions needed for an ontological reconciliation between 
environmental sustainability and economic growth. 
Sustainable development is often seen as envisioning a future that aligns with the risks posed by 
current human activities in relation to nature (Eizenberg & Jabareen, 2017). According to Beck 
(1992), since the 1960s, modernity has been characterized by an anticipation of and control over 
the future consequences of human actions. This theory suggests that once society becomes aware 
of the hazards it has internally generated, it becomes increasingly focused on risk management, 
making modern society intrinsically linked to the concept of uncertainty. Both spatially and 
temporally (given the irreversibility of certain negative effects), the existence of global risks 
amplifies the need for anticipation and control (Beck, 2005). 
This interpretation of sustainable development compels us to directly confront the effects of 
economic consumption and production on the environment. As a result, traditional analysis has 
primarily focused on critiquing the economic growth model to prevent ecological disasters and 
other irreversible harm that could compromise humanity’s ability to live a "genuine human life" 
on Earth (Jonas, 1984), or at least to maintain current living standards. However, this conceptual 
framework is fundamentally flawed if it disregards the social dimension. This oversight of the 
social aspect can largely be attributed to biases in the formulation of public policies (Murphy, 
2012). 
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The One Health Approach: An Integrative Perspective 
 
The One Health concept highlights the close links between human, animal, and environmental 
health, emphasizing the interdependence of these systems for equitable sustainable development 
(Zinsstag et al. 2010; Destoumieux-Garzón et al. 2018). In vulnerable areas, where zoonotic and 
environmental risks converge, this approach becomes crucial in terms of social justice. For 
example, integrated management of pandemic risks such as Ebola or avian flu in sub-Saharan 
African regions has strengthened the resilience of healthcare systems while reducing social 
inequalities. Moreover, deforestation, uncontrolled urbanization, and the overexploitation of 
natural resources in these regions not only increase ecological risks but also exacerbate social 
vulnerabilities (e.g. Mills et al. 2010). Therefore, sustainability strategies must integrate these 
public health considerations to reduce social divides and protect the most disadvantaged from the 
impacts of environmental changes. True sustainability cannot be achieved without this 
comprehensive integration of social and health dimensions within environmental policies. 
 
What does the social dimension encompass? 
 
When it hasn’t been entirely neglected, the social dimension of sustainable development has often 
been limited to examining the relationship between poverty and the degradation of natural 
resources (Ballet et al., 2011). As a result, it continues to be seen as a lesser dimension, with the 
primary focus remaining on determining an economic growth rate that is compatible with both 
preserving nature and reducing poverty. This narrow approach reflects the trajectory set out by the 
Brundtland Report (Robinson, 2004). 
At best, the social dimension has become a "catchword" (Littig & Griessler, 2005), representing a 
variety of forces that either link the other two dimensions or drive them apart. It has also become 
the default category for issues that don’t neatly fit into the economic or environmental dimensions. 
Reviews by Griessler and Littig (2005), Vallance et al. (2011), and Murphy (2012) identify two 
primary ways the social dimension has been analyzed: a) by exploring the connection between 
living conditions and environmental concerns, and b) by examining the social acceptance of 
behavioral change. 
Rather than defining the social dimension as a mere repository for issues not covered by the other 
two dimensions, there are clear criteria that can guide its characterization. We propose three 
fundamental criteria. 
The first criterion is the level of equity in society. Equity is the most frequently mentioned topic in 
the literature on the social dimension of sustainable development (Jabareen, 2008). Furthermore, 
research on environmental justice has demonstrated the deep interconnection between the social 
and environmental dimensions (Schlosberg, 2007). To some extent, social inequity can help 
explain environmental inequity (Pellow, 2000). Thus, it is insufficient to focus solely on poverty 
and basic needs or to rely on the notion that economic growth will trickle down to alleviate poverty. 
In fact, the trickle-down effect is far less effective in economies plagued by inequity, where the 
relationship between poverty, inequity, and growth is highly complex (Adams, 2004; Bourguignon, 
2004). 
The second criterion is the level of safety experienced by a community, where safety refers to 
protection from economic and social risks (social risks being a key developmental issue [Fiszbein 
et al., 2014]). This protection can significantly impact the living conditions of a community, 
helping its members avoid falling into poverty traps (Barrett et al., 2016). Studies conducted in 
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Zambia and Honduras, as well as programs in southern Asia (Chaudhury et al., 2011; Bee et al., 
2013; Davies et al., 2013), have shown the effectiveness of new flexible social policies that link 
social protection with climate and environmental events. 
The third criterion is the level of social cohesion. Social cohesion has been the subject of many 
debates in the social sciences, but in its simplest form, it can be understood as the coherence in 
attitudes and behaviors among members of a group (Friedkin, 2004). In a society, social cohesion 
reflects the consistency in the attitudes and behaviors of its members. Consequently, environmental 
conflicts are often deeply rooted in social antagonisms (Urdal, 2005; Raleigh & Urdal, 2007). 
Broadly speaking, greater coherence in political decision-making is more likely when there are 
higher levels of equity, safety, and social cohesion. While this does not mean that pro-environment 
policies will be easy to implement, they will at least not suffer from the incoherence that arises 
when the social dimension is neglected. 
 
Potential interest for researchers and opportunities 
 
This paper opens new avenues for research by reframing sustainable development through the lens 
of social justice. Researchers in fields such as environmental science, public policy, sociology, and 
economics can benefit from our expanded definition of the social dimension, which we propose as 
central to achieving true sustainability. By highlighting the intricate interconnections between 
social equity, environmental protection, and economic stability, this work provides a 
comprehensive framework that can guide future interdisciplinary studies on how these pillars 
interact. 
Furthermore, our approach underscores the importance of integrating social cohesion and equity 
into environmental policies, offering new insights for scholars exploring the link between 
environmental justice and social policy. This can also serve as a foundation for applied research 
into policy-making, enabling a more holistic understanding of the complex dynamics that must be 
considered in the design and implementation of sustainable development strategies. 
By moving beyond the traditional focus on poverty alleviation, we argue for a more nuanced view 
of the social dimension that is equally relevant to both developed and developing nations. This shift 
in perspective not only enhances the relevance of this work across global contexts but also presents 
a significant opportunity for researchers to investigate how different societies might adapt these 
principles to address local challenges. Ultimately, this paper contributes to the growing body of 
research that positions social justice as indispensable in the path toward global sustainability. 
 
Why should the social dimension be taken seriously? 
 
 Two distinct yet complementary issues highlight the growing importance of the social 
dimension in sustainable development. Firstly, the social dimension serves as a crucial interface 
between the economic and environmental dimensions. Whether we are discussing living conditions 
or the social acceptance of necessary changes aimed at preserving nature, the three criteria—equity 
in society, community safety from economic and social risks, and social cohesion—facilitate the 
mechanisms that drive transformative change. Conversely, social fragmentation, as evidenced by 
movements like the 'yellow vests,' creates resistance to such changes. Much like the environmental 
dimension, the social dimension is vulnerable to social disruptions, making it susceptible to 
shockwaves. These vulnerabilities stem not only from individual fragility but also from the broader 
societal context (Corcuff, 2002). As individual vulnerability is linked to societal vulnerability, the 
social dimension reflects the fragility of society as a whole (Ranci, 2009). The ripple effects of 
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social shockwaves can undermine the effectiveness of pro-environmental actions. If, as with the 
'yellow vests' in France, the social dimension is neglected or overshadowed, efforts to address 
environmental issues will inevitably be rejected. 
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